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Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its Transaction

Name *

Department *

ASH

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that the
quality of the syllabus
taught to you is
comparable to that of
other universities?

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

Are you satisfied with the
current curriculum's
ability to meet your
academic and career
goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes were
explained to you in each
subject by the teacher?

Course content is well
structured and adequate
to achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching hours
(credits) were allocated in
your timetable for all
subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books listed in
your syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial collection of
high-quality textbooks
and reference materials.

The internal evaluation
practices are transparent,
and the grievance
redressal system for
internal assessment is

Do you agree that the
quality of the syllabus
taught to you is
comparable to that of
other universities?

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

Are you satisfied with the
current curriculum's
ability to meet your
academic and career
goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes were
explained to you in each
subject by the teacher?

Course content is well
structured and adequate
to achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching hours
(credits) were allocated in
your timetable for all
subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books listed in
your syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial collection of
high-quality textbooks
and reference materials.

The internal evaluation
practices are transparent,
and the grievance
redressal system for
internal assessment is
efficient and adheres to
set timelines. 2 



Certification courses in Web development, C, C++, Python, and other subjects be made available.

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

efficient and adheres to
set timelines.

The teacher frequently
utilizes audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and enrich the
effectiveness of the
teaching-learning
process.

Do you agree that
departmental efforts are
effective in improving
communication, technical
and professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

The department's
initiatives, such as expert
talks, workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contribute to
the professional
development of students.

The department actively
assists students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions and
offering support for
competitive examination.

The teacher frequently
utilizes audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and enrich the
effectiveness of the
teaching-learning
process.

Do you agree that
departmental efforts are
effective in improving
communication, technical
and professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

The department's
initiatives, such as expert
talks, workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contribute to
the professional
development of students.

The department actively
assists students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions and
offering support for
competitive examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum
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This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the library,
classrooms, and
laboratories is supportive
of learning and sports
and cultural facilities are
conducive to your overall
development.

Adequate infrastructure
and support are available,
including classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching tools,
well-equipped
laboratories, hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the library,
classrooms, and
laboratories is supportive
of learning and sports
and cultural facilities are
conducive to your overall
development.

Adequate infrastructure
and support are available,
including classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching tools,
well-equipped
laboratories, hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Dr Anita Malik

ASH

Professor

2019-2020

Mathematics

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

The syllabus contents are
well-sequenced, and the
allocation of credits to
each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-date
and aligned with current
industry requirements.

The syllabus content is
sufficient to achieve the
stated Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute facilitates
teachers' participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course outcomes are
clearly defined, and the
process for achieving
program outcomes is
relevant to the course(s)
being taught.

The recommended texts
and reference books
listed in the syllabus are
pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-quality
and relevant textbooks
and reference materials
to meet students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in cultivating
analytical, problem-
solving and design
thinking abilities.

The internal examination
and evaluation system

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

The syllabus contents are
well-sequenced, and the
allocation of credits to
each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-date
and aligned with current
industry requirements.

The syllabus content is
sufficient to achieve the
stated Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute facilitates
teachers' participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course outcomes are
clearly defined, and the
process for achieving
program outcomes is
relevant to the course(s)
being taught.

The recommended texts
and reference books
listed in the syllabus are
pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-quality
and relevant textbooks
and reference materials
to meet students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in cultivating
analytical, problem-
solving and design
thinking abilities.

The internal examination
and evaluation system 6 



It is also advised that the library update its collection with the newest book versions.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

ensures fair assessment
of students' academic
progress.

External experts from
academia and industry
who bring relevant
expertise are frequently
invited to conduct
workshops, seminars,
and lectures.

ensures fair assessment
of students' academic
progress.

External experts from
academia and industry
who bring relevant
expertise are frequently
invited to conduct
workshops, seminars,
and lectures.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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SANYAM GARG 

18231

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction

Name *

Department *

BBA

Roll No *

Academic Year *

2019-20
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

9 



The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits 10 



industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

External expert can do sessions to build our real world business understanding.

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 
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Books about computer in the library

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

Forms

12 

https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms


Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Priti Singh

Department *

BBA

Designation *

Assistant Professor

Academic Year *

2019-20

Subject(s) Taught *

Finance

13 



Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes

14 



is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

15 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

We need to align curriculum with industry requirements. Teach emerging topics on Financial Strategy

Forms
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Harish Sharma

BBA

2013

Ganpath Textiles Pvt Ltd

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the 
curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students 
are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring 
that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your 
participation will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *

17 



Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for

18 



professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.

professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.

19 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

Organize more workshops, expert talks related to professional development.

Forms
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Email *

hr@evelynlearning.com

Tushar Verma

HR

Evelyn Learning Systems

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to 
you for providing them employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be 
grateful to you if you can spare some of your valuable time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us 
to improve further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *

21 



Delhi

98738 14760

Employer's Feedback 

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Branch/Location *

Contact *

22 



How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

The curriculum contents
23 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

The curriculum contents
are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

 



Forms
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Shivam

17508

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction

Name *

Department *

BCA

Roll No *

Academic Year  *

25 



Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

h b k d
26 



The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits 27 



Arrange Short Terms Practical Course on Machine Learning

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

28 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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UPASNA

BCA

ASSISTANT PROFESSOR

2019-20

BUSINESS INTELLEGENCE & ENTERPRENUERSHIP

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *

30 



Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes
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is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.
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ADDITIONAL COURSES ON EMERGING TECHNOLOGY SUCH MACHINE LEARNING SHOULD BE OFFERED.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Jyoti

BCA

2015

Working in Company

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the 
curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students 
are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring 
that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your 
participation will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for
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professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.

professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.
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Department should organize more expert talks and industrial visit for industrial exposure and to get 
familiar new advanced technologies.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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HARSHIT KAUSHIK

2816609

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction

Name *

Department *

Civil

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in 43 



were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools in
the classroom to
enhance and enrich
the effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are effective
in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools in
the classroom to
enhance and enrich
the effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are effective
in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

The department's 44 



Additional courses in the field of structure design should be offered

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum
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This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and sports
and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-equipped
laboratories,
hostels, auditorium,
and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and sports
and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-equipped
laboratories,
hostels, auditorium,
and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Lalit

Civil Engineering

AP

2019-20

DM, GWH

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a
good balance
between core and
applied subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and the
allocation of credits
to each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-
date and aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus content
is sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates teachers'
participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are clearly
defined, and the
process for achieving
program outcomes is
relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and reference
books listed in the

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a
good balance
between core and
applied subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and the
allocation of credits
to each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-
date and aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus content
is sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates teachers'
participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are clearly
defined, and the
process for achieving
program outcomes is
relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and reference
books listed in the
syllabus are 48 



Expert lecture/workshop/sessions related to latest development and new trends in civil engineering should be 
organized.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

syllabus are
pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-
quality and relevant
textbooks and
reference materials
to meet students'
overall academic
needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating analytical,
problem-solving and
design thinking
abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students' academic
progress.

External experts
from academia and
industry who bring
relevant expertise are
frequently invited to
conduct workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-
quality and relevant
textbooks and
reference materials
to meet students'
overall academic
needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating analytical,
problem-solving and
design thinking
abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students' academic
progress.

External experts
from academia and
industry who bring
relevant expertise are
frequently invited to
conduct workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Wasif Khurshid

Civil

 2018

Working

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the curriculum 
and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students are incredibly 
important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring that current and 
future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your participation will be highly 
appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your degree
program provides a
good balance between
core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you
are comparable with
what your workplace
colleagues studied in
other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree program
is relevant and has
helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain the
desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled

The syllabus taught to
you during your degree
program provides a
good balance between
core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you
are comparable with
what your workplace
colleagues studied in
other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree program
is relevant and has
helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain the
desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop 51 



me to develop
professional skills
essential for
professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me to
identify available
career opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT tools,
laboratories, and
library) provided to you
by institute, helped you
effectively in the
industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni

p
professional skills
essential for
professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me to
identify available
career opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT tools,
laboratories, and
library) provided to you
by institute, helped you
effectively in the
industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are 52 



Expert lectures related to new techniques in civil engineering should be organized

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Connect are
commendable.
commendable.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Email *

HR@authbridge.com

Payal Aggarwal 

HR

 AUTHBRIDGE

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to you 
for providing them employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be grateful to 
you if you can spare some of your valuable time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us to improve 
further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *
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Gurgaon

8506814541

Employer's Feedback 

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Branch/Location *

Contact *

55 



How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in 56 



Department need to put more efforts to enhance technical knowledge and skills among students by 
organizing workshops/ sessions on contemporary construction techniques in collaboration with industry

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

problem-solving skills in
students.

The curriculum contents
are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

p g
students.

The curriculum contents
are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

Any other comments/suggestions 

 Forms
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TANYA SHARMA

2818273

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its Transaction

Name *

Department *

Electronics

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that the
quality of the syllabus
taught to you is
comparable to that of
other universities?

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

Are you satisfied with
the current curriculum's
ability to meet your
academic and career
goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes were
explained to you in each
subject by the teacher?

Course content is well
structured and adequate
to achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching hours
(credits) were allocated
in your timetable for all
subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books listed in
your syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial collection of
high-quality textbooks
and reference materials.

The internal evaluation
practices are
transparent, and the
grievance redressal
system for internal
assessment is efficient
and adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher frequently
utilizes audio-visual

Do you agree that the
quality of the syllabus
taught to you is
comparable to that of
other universities?

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

Are you satisfied with
the current curriculum's
ability to meet your
academic and career
goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes were
explained to you in each
subject by the teacher?

Course content is well
structured and adequate
to achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching hours
(credits) were allocated
in your timetable for all
subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books listed in
your syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial collection of
high-quality textbooks
and reference materials.

The internal evaluation
practices are
transparent, and the
grievance redressal
system for internal
assessment is efficient
and adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher frequently
utilizes audio-visual
t l i th l t 76 



provide add on course on MicroDesign of electronics

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

tools in the classroom to
enhance and enrich the
effectiveness of the
teaching-learning
process.

Do you agree that
departmental efforts are
effective in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks, workshops,
and industrial visits,
effectively contribute to
the professional
development of
students.

The department actively
assists students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

tools in the classroom to
enhance and enrich the
effectiveness of the
teaching-learning
process.

Do you agree that
departmental efforts are
effective in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks, workshops,
and industrial visits,
effectively contribute to
the professional
development of
students.

The department actively
assists students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

77 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the library,
classrooms, and
laboratories is
supportive of learning
and sports and cultural
facilities are conducive
to your overall
development.

Adequate infrastructure
and support are
available, including
classrooms equipped
with ICT-enabled
teaching tools, well-
equipped laboratories,
hostels, auditorium, and
a comprehensive library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the library,
classrooms, and
laboratories is
supportive of learning
and sports and cultural
facilities are conducive
to your overall
development.

Adequate infrastructure
and support are
available, including
classrooms equipped
with ICT-enabled
teaching tools, well-
equipped laboratories,
hostels, auditorium, and
a comprehensive library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Vikas Goyal

ECE

AP

2019-20

Microcontroller and Embedded system

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

The syllabus contents
are well-sequenced, and
the allocation of credits
to each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-date
and aligned with current
industry requirements.

The syllabus content is
sufficient to achieve the
stated Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute facilitates
teachers' participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course outcomes
are clearly defined, and
the process for
achieving program
outcomes is relevant to
the course(s) being
taught.

The recommended texts
and reference books
listed in the syllabus are
pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-quality
and relevant textbooks
and reference materials
to meet students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in cultivating
analytical, problem-
solving and design
thinking abilities.

The internal examination
and evaluation system
ensures fair assessment

Do you agree that the
curriculum offers a good
balance between core
and applied subjects?

The syllabus contents
are well-sequenced, and
the allocation of credits
to each course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that the
curriculum is up-to-date
and aligned with current
industry requirements.

The syllabus content is
sufficient to achieve the
stated Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute facilitates
teachers' participation in
university curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course outcomes
are clearly defined, and
the process for
achieving program
outcomes is relevant to
the course(s) being
taught.

The recommended texts
and reference books
listed in the syllabus are
pertinent and useful.

Library has extensive
collection of high-quality
and relevant textbooks
and reference materials
to meet students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in cultivating
analytical, problem-
solving and design
thinking abilities.

The internal examination
and evaluation system
ensures fair assessment
of students' academic
progress.
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VAC should add on robotics. include potential books in department library

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

of students' academic
progress.

External experts from
academia and industry
who bring relevant
expertise are frequently
invited to conduct
workshops, seminars,
and lectures.

External experts from
academia and industry
who bring relevant
expertise are frequently
invited to conduct
workshops, seminars,
and lectures.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Lakshay

ECE

2019

Maxbrox

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the educational experience at 
P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your 
insights and experiences as former students are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for 
improvement, ensuring that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your participation 
will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to you
during your degree program
provides a good balance
between core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you are
comparable with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the curriculum
has effectively prepared me
for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught during
degree program is relevant
and has helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the program in
various semesters have been
beneficial to my professional
career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have helped
me to attain the desired
graduate attributes.

Internships and projects
have enabled me to develop
professional skills essential
for professional growth and
career readiness.

The textbooks and reference
materials listed in the
syllabus are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives on
innovation and
entrepreneurship have been
helpful for your current roles
and responsibilities.

The department's initiatives,
such as expert talks,
workshops, and industrial
visits, effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The syllabus taught to you
during your degree program
provides a good balance
between core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you are
comparable with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the curriculum
has effectively prepared me
for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught during
degree program is relevant
and has helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the program in
various semesters have been
beneficial to my professional
career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have helped
me to attain the desired
graduate attributes.

Internships and projects
have enabled me to develop
professional skills essential
for professional growth and
career readiness.

The textbooks and reference
materials listed in the
syllabus are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives on
innovation and
entrepreneurship have been
helpful for your current roles
and responsibilities.

The department's initiatives,
such as expert talks,
workshops, and industrial
visits, effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department actively
i d id if 83 



Department should conduct some expert talk on chip design as per needs of future demand

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

The department actively
assisted me to identify
available career
opportunities by organizing
career counseling sessions
and offering support for
competitive examinations.

The academic support and
facilities (classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to you by
institute, helped you
effectively in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni web
portal and other initiatives of
Alumni Connect are
commendable.

assisted me to identify
available career
opportunities by organizing
career counseling sessions
and offering support for
competitive examinations.

The academic support and
facilities (classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to you by
institute, helped you
effectively in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni web
portal and other initiatives of
Alumni Connect are
commendable.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Email *

info@hikeedu.in

Divya Dubey

HR

HIKE EDUCATION

Delhi

9745000911

Employer's Feedback 

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to you for providing them 
employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be grateful to you if you can spare some of your valuable 
time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us to improve further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *

Branch/Location *

Contact *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Any seminar/lecture may help students on application of technology. further, to enhance syllabus, some course offer to students as 
per indistry demands

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General communication skills

Technical knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and takes
responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work beyond
schedule

Uphold professional ethics in
their current roles

Collaborative teamwork skills

Effective
leadership/management skills

Open-minded and enthusiastic
about adopting new ideas and
learning innovative techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in their
work

The curriculum taught has
nurtured creative thinking
skills among students.

The curriculum emphasized
fostering problem-solving
skills in students.

The curriculum contents are
aligned with current industrial
requirements.

General communication skills

Technical knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and takes
responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work beyond
schedule

Uphold professional ethics in
their current roles

Collaborative teamwork skills

Effective
leadership/management skills

Open-minded and enthusiastic
about adopting new ideas and
learning innovative techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in their
work

The curriculum taught has
nurtured creative thinking
skills among students.

The curriculum emphasized
fostering problem-solving
skills in students.

The curriculum contents are
aligned with current industrial
requirements.

Any other comments/suggestions 

 Forms
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Jyoti Shakla

180119

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

MBA

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

h b k d
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The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits 106 



I believe sessions on advanced excel would be helpful, also suggest more lectures on digital marketing 
and Indian economy 

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum
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This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Dr. Himanshu Jain

DMS

Associate Professor

2019-20

Accounts and finance

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes
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is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.
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Courses on excel, financial modelling are suggested

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms

112 

https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms


Hitesh Dhall

MBA

2018

Gurugram

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the 
curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students 
are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring 
that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your 
participation will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for
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professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.

professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.
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More career  counseling sessions should be conducted mainly in the area of banking, insurance, and 
finance. More alumni should be called for taking sessions with students. 

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Email *

rahul.sharma@vrindaglobal.com

Rahul Sharma

HR

VRINDA GLOBAL

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to 
you for providing them employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be 
grateful to you if you can spare some of your valuable time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us 
to improve further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *
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Karnal

-

Employer's Feedback 

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Branch/Location *

Contact *
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How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

The curriculum contents
119 



Please work on team skills and technical skills 

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

The curriculum contents
are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

Any other comments/suggestions 

 Forms

120 

https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms
https://www.google.com/forms/about/?utm_source=product&utm_medium=forms_logo&utm_campaign=forms


Vaibhav

19777

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction

Name *

Department *

MCA

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

h b k d
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The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits 123 



Arrange Short term practical course on machine learning and additional courses on cyber security.

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

124 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Dr. DInesh Verma

MCA

ASSISTANT PROFESSOR

2019-20

DBMS , C

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year  *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
sufficient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and
Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are
clearly defined,
and the process
for achieving
program outcomes
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is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

is relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and
reference books
listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.
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ADDITIONAL COURSES ON MACHINE LEARNING SHOULD BE ORGANISED

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Vishal 

MCA

2016

Working in Company

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the 
curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students 
are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring 
that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your 
participation will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for

The syllabus taught to
you during your
degree program
provides a good
balance between core
and applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are comparable
with what your
workplace colleagues
studied in other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree
program is relevant
and has helped me to
fulfill industry
requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain
the desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop
professional skills
essential for
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professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.

professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and
useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me
to identify available
career opportunities
by organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories, and
library) provided to
you by institute,
helped you effectively
in the industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are
commendable.
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Additional Course should be arranged in the field of machine learning

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Email *

contact@srtekbox.com

Sofiya Sharma

HR

SR TEK BOX

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to 
you for providing them employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be 
grateful to you if you can spare some of your valuable time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us 
to improve further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

The respondent's email (contact@srtekbox.com) was recorded on submission of this form.

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *
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Sonipat

+91 - 9992907778

Employer's Feedback 

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Branch/Location *

Contact *
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How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

General communication
skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and work
beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative teamwork
skills

Effective
leadership/management
skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas and
learning innovative
techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning, and
project management in
their work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills in
students.

The curriculum contents
136 



This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

The curriculum contents
are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

are aligned with current
industrial requirements.

Any other comments/suggestions 

 Forms
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Abhishek

2817406

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction

Name *

Department *

Mechanical

Roll No *

Academic Year  *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satisfied
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus covers
topics that are
contemporary and
aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
sufficient teaching
hours (credits)
were allocated in
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were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and enrich
the effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are effective
in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.

your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
efficient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and enrich
the effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are effective
in improving
communication,
technical and
professional skills
fostering overall
development of the
student.
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i request for conduction of workshops related to robotics

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support for
competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum
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This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:   *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and sports
and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-equipped
laboratories,
hostels, auditorium,
and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and sports
and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-equipped
laboratories,
hostels, auditorium,
and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions

 Forms
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Rohit Saini

ME

2019

MBA

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message finds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the curriculum 
and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students are incredibly 
important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring that current and 
future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your participation will be highly 
appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation  *

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus taught to
you during your degree
program provides a
good balance between
core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you
are comparable with
what your workplace
colleagues studied in
other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree program
is relevant and has
helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain the
desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled

The syllabus taught to
you during your degree
program provides a
good balance between
core and applied
subjects.

Courses studied by you
are comparable with
what your workplace
colleagues studied in
other
institutes/universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively prepared
me for pursuing higher
education or securing
employment.

The syllabus taught
during degree program
is relevant and has
helped me to fulfill
industry requirements.

The electives offered
throughout the
program in various
semesters have been
beneficial to my
professional career.

The curriculum and its
implementation have
helped me to attain the
desired graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have enabled
me to develop 148 



me to develop
professional skills
essential for
professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me to
identify available
career opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT tools,
laboratories, and
library) provided to you
by institute, helped you
effectively in the
industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni

p
professional skills
essential for
professional growth
and career readiness.

The textbooks and
reference materials
listed in the syllabus
are relevant and useful.

Institutional initiatives
on innovation and
entrepreneurship have
been helpful for your
current roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively contributed
to my professional
development.

The department
actively assisted me to
identify available
career opportunities by
organizing career
counseling sessions
and offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic support
and facilities
(classrooms, ICT tools,
laboratories, and
library) provided to you
by institute, helped you
effectively in the
industry.

The Institute’s alumni
web portal and other
initiatives of Alumni
Connect are 149 



Additional courses should be taught in the trending industry domain like EV's.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Connect are
commendable.
commendable.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

 Forms
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Email *

info@bloombraineducation.com

Smita Rawat

HR

BLOOM BRAIN LEARNING SOLUTIONS

Employer' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Employer,

Graduates of our prestigious Institute are working in your esteemed organization. We are thankful to you 
for providing them employment with your Organization. We will very much appreciate and be grateful to 
you if you can spare some of your valuable time to fill up this feedback form. It will help us to improve 
further and give you better employees in future.

Regards 

Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology

Name *

Designation *

Name of the organization *
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Ghaziabad

1800-2120944

Employer's Feedback 

Please tick (√) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:

Branch/Location *

Contact *
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How satisfied are you with the student’s work performance in each of these areas: *

Very Satisfied Satisfied Not sure Dissatisfied

General
communication skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and
work beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative
teamwork skills

Effective
leadership/manageme
nt skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas
and learning
innovative techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning,
and project
management in their
work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

General
communication skills

Technical
knowledge/skill

Shows initiative and
takes responsibility

Ability to take up extra
responsibility and
work beyond schedule

Uphold professional
ethics in their current
roles

Collaborative
teamwork skills

Effective
leadership/manageme
nt skills

Open-minded and
enthusiastic about
adopting new ideas
and learning
innovative techniques

Understand and apply
principles, planning,
and project
management in their
work

The curriculum taught
has nurtured creative
thinking skills among
students.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
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Institute should conduct classes on latest technology like EV's.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

The curriculum
emphasized fostering
problem-solving skills
in students.

The curriculum
contents are aligned
with current industrial
requirements.

problem-solving skills
in students.

The curriculum
contents are aligned
with current industrial
requirements.

Any other comments/suggestions 

 Forms
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Gulshan

2817501

2019-20

Students' Feedback on Curriculum

Students' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Textile

Roll No *

Academic Year *
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Please tick ( ) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:  *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satis ed
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
su cient teaching

Do you agree that
the quality of the
syllabus taught to
you is comparable
to that of other
universities?

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

Are you satis ed
with the current
curriculum's ability
to meet your
academic and
career goals?

The syllabus
covers topics that
are contemporary
and aligned with
industry
requirements.

Course Outcomes
were explained to
you in each subject
by the teacher?

Course content is
well structured and
adequate to
achieve expected
course outcomes.

Do you agree that
su cient teaching

156 



hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
e cient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and

hours (credits)
were allocated in
your timetable for
all subjects?

The textbooks and
reference books
listed in your
syllabus were
relevant and
useful.

The library has a
substantial
collection of high-
quality textbooks
and reference
materials.

The internal
evaluation
practices are
transparent, and
the grievance
redressal system
for internal
assessment is
e cient and
adheres to set
timelines.

The teacher
frequently utilizes
audio-visual tools
in the classroom to
enhance and
enrich the
effectiveness of
the teaching-
learning process.

Do you agree that
departmental
efforts are
effective in
improving
communication,
technical and
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industrial visit to knitting section should be organised

Student’s Feedback on Ambience 

professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

professional skills
fostering overall
development of
the student.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contribute to the
professional
development of
students.

The department
actively assists
students in
identifying career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examination.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum
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This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

Please tick ( ) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:  *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Do you agree that
ambience in the
library, classrooms,
and laboratories is
supportive of
learning and
sports and cultural
facilities are
conducive to your
overall
development.

Adequate
infrastructure and
support are
available, including
classrooms
equipped with ICT-
enabled teaching
tools, well-
equipped
laboratories,
hostels,
auditorium, and a
comprehensive
library.

Any other comments/suggestions on Ambience 

Forms
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Subhasish Pal

Textile Engineering

Assistant Professor

2019-20

TF-I, TF-II, SPF

Teachers' Feedback on  Syllabus and its
Transaction 

Name *

Department *

Designation *

Academic Year *

Subject(s) Taught *
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Please tick ( ) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question:  *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

Do you agree that
the curriculum
offers a good
balance between
core and applied
subjects?

The syllabus
contents are well-
sequenced, and
the allocation of
credits to each
course is
appropriate.

Do you agree that
the curriculum is
up-to-date and
aligned with
current industry
requirements.

The syllabus
content is
su cient to
achieve the stated
Course Outcomes
(COs) and Program
Outcomes (POs).

The institute
facilitates
teachers'
participation in
university
curriculum
development and
additional courses.

The course
outcomes are

161 



clearly de ned, and
the process for
achieving program
outcomes is
relevant to the
course(s) being
taught.

The recommended
texts and reference
books listed in the
syllabus are
pertinent and
useful.

Library has
extensive
collection of high-
quality and
relevant textbooks
and reference
materials to meet
students' overall
academic needs.

The syllabus aids
students in
cultivating
analytical,
problem-solving
and design
thinking abilities.

The internal
examination and
evaluation system
ensures fair
assessment of
students'
academic
progress.

External experts
from academia
and industry who
bring relevant
expertise are
frequently invited
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courses related to quality control in carpet manufacturing can be organized.

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

to conduct
workshops,
seminars, and
lectures.

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

Forms
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Piyush Kakkar

Textile Engineering

2018

Alumni' Feedback on Syllabus and its
Transaction 
Dear Alumni,

We hope this message nds you well. As part of our continuous effort to improve and enhance the 
educational experience at P.I.E.T., we are reaching out to gather your valuable feedback on the 
curriculum and the overall ambience of the institute. Your insights and experiences as former students 
are incredibly important to us. It will help us to identify strengths and areas for improvement, ensuring 
that current and future students receive the best possible education and environment. Your 
participation will be highly appreciated and will play a crucial role in shaping the future our institute.

Please spare few moments to complete the survey.

Thank you for your time and support.

Name *

Department *

Year of Graduation *
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working

Working /Studying in *
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Please tick ( ) the response that best describes your level of satisfaction for each question: *

Strongly Agree Agree Not sure Disagree

The syllabus
taught to you
during your degree
program provides
a good balance
between core and
applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are
comparable with
what your
workplace
colleagues studied
in other institutes/
universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively
prepared me for
pursuing higher
education or
securing
employment.

The syllabus
taught during
degree program is
relevant and has
helped me to ful ll
industry
requirements.

The electives
offered throughout
the program in
various semesters
have been
bene cial to my
professional

The syllabus
taught to you
during your degree
program provides
a good balance
between core and
applied subjects.

Courses studied by
you are
comparable with
what your
workplace
colleagues studied
in other institutes/
universities?

Contents of the
curriculum has
effectively
prepared me for
pursuing higher
education or
securing
employment.

The syllabus
taught during
degree program is
relevant and has
helped me to ful ll
industry
requirements.

The electives
offered throughout
the program in
various semesters
have been
bene cial to my
professional
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career.

The curriculum
and its
implementation
have helped me to
attain the desired
graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have
enabled me to
develop
professional skills
essential for
professional
growth and career
readiness.

The textbooks and
reference
materials listed in
the syllabus are
relevant and
useful.

Institutional
initiatives on
innovation and
entrepreneurship
have been helpful
for your current
roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contributed to my
professional
development.

The department
actively assisted

career.

The curriculum
and its
implementation
have helped me to
attain the desired
graduate
attributes.

Internships and
projects have
enabled me to
develop
professional skills
essential for
professional
growth and career
readiness.

The textbooks and
reference
materials listed in
the syllabus are
relevant and
useful.

Institutional
initiatives on
innovation and
entrepreneurship
have been helpful
for your current
roles and
responsibilities.

The department's
initiatives, such as
expert talks,
workshops, and
industrial visits,
effectively
contributed to my
professional
development.
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workshop or expert talks on advacement in manufacturing must be organised

This form was created inside of Panipat Institute of Engineering & Technology.

me to identify
available career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic
support and
facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories,
and library)
provided to you by
institute, helped
you effectively in
the industry.

The Institute’s
alumni web portal
and other
initiatives of
Alumni Connect
are commendable.

The department
actively assisted
me to identify
available career
opportunities by
organizing career
counseling
sessions and
offering support
for competitive
examinations.

The academic
support and
facilities
(classrooms, ICT
tools, laboratories,
and library)
provided to you by
institute, helped
you effectively in
the industry.

The Institute’s
alumni web portal
and other
initiatives of
Alumni Connect

Any other comments/suggestions on Curriculum

Forms
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